
Clinician  
 Full-Time Position (37.5hours/wk.) 

$36,465 - $38,025 
 
 
Children’s Advocacy Programs of the Blue Ridge, Inc. is seeking a master’s level clinician 
(license is not a requirement, but preferred) to work full-time with children and non-offending 
family members impacted by family and community-based violence. Qualified applicant will be 
proficient in assessing client needs, implementing treatment plans, and evaluating outcomes.  
Applicants will participate on our local multidisciplinary response to child abuse, administer 
grant required tasks, and participate in peer review supervision. Additional consideration will be 
recognized for those trained and experienced in trauma focused cognitive behavioral therapy 
(TF-CBT) and/or Eye Movement Desensitization and Reprocessing (EMDR), as well as, 
experience with court advocacy.  
 
A list of duties and/or responsibilities, training expectations, education, and competencies are 
included in the full job description, as well as, the application for employment are available at 
www.southernvacac.org or by contacting info@southernvacac.org Salary negotiable based on 
experience and hours worked. This full-time position offers 37.5 hours of employment per week; 
compensation based on hours worked and experience. Hourly rate ranges between $18.70/hr. and 
$19.50 per hour. Limited benefits available. This is a grant funded position. Background checks 
will be conducted prior to consideration of employment. Completed applications, references, 
resume, and a letter detailing availability and expected compensation should be returned to the 
Southern Virginia Child Advocacy Center, 300 South Main Street, Rocky Mount, Virginia, 
24151 or by email (info@southernvacac.org) no later than February 24, 2023 by 4:00 p.m. 
Additional consideration will be considered to those with experience working with children and 
adolescents, experience with billing, and insurance paneling.  No faxes accepted. CAPS of the 
Blue Ridge, Inc. is an AA/EEO employer. 
 
++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 
VEC 
Indeed 
Facebook 
CAPS’ Website 
CART Team Distribution 
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